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OMR HOME

Sarthak Khandelwal <sarthak.khandelwal@gingerwebs.com>
To: Jagan Mohan R <jagan@mgmcri.ac.in>
Cc: Manmohan Rana <manmohan@omrhome.com>

Dear Sir,

Jagan Mohan <drjagan@gmail.com>

9 October 2013 at 14:15

-

•

Hope you are doing well !!

As per your conversation with Mr. Manmohan, I have attached the Quotation for the OMR Software.

Please find the attached file.

I am lookihg forward positively to the opportunity and prospect of mutual business relationship. Please feel free to
contact mite for any query regarding my product and services.

Best Reghrds,
Sarthak Khandelwal

[Quoted text hidden)
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9M8.H9ME@)
A product of GingerWebs Pvt. Ltd.
LGF, Plot No.2, Multitech Tower, Aggarwal Plaza. Sec-16, Rohini, Delhi-110089, India

Tel: 011-27292S5S
Website: www .gingerwebs .com/ Email: sarthak.khandelwal@gingerwebs.com QUOTATION

Company Name: Mahatma Gandhi Medical colllege and Resarch Institute

Dr. Jagan Mohan
Pondicherry, India
Email: jagan@mqmcri.ac.in

Quota tion#
Date

GW/SK/JM/211.l
09/10/2013

Dear Dr Jagan,

•

•

...
e

~ ....,;·,--.

lll.40.500 + 5%Tax
0 -;c:::

Rs.33,750 + 5% Tax (Esh)

:; -~ ....
Payment Terms:
- AdvancePurchaseOrderwith100%payment for softwareand Kanner. ·......~-~~ -,,.1.~- -~·I

Terms and Condition
• Internet connec tivity mandatory for support through desktop sharing software
• One year online support and update of software free of cost
• Annual Maintenance Charge (AMC): Rs. 8,500 (Not Mandatory)
• Quo ta tion is valid for 1 month
• Software will be for life time basis
• Onsite insta lla tion and training refers to 3 A.C fare as per Indian Railways

5 Licenses of Barcode Module/.,. . '" <,:-2,
Recommended ADF Scanners

·-•1:Unltof Fujitsu Fl 6USLA3CIP
Sheets

SITE License(5U.-) of Verifiare (Multiple template)

• Readall kind of OMR sheet used for Exami nation, Admi ssion, Assessmen(
Recruitment and Surveys .
• Data can be exported into Excel, HTML, XML. PDF and CSV.
• Can run on anywindows basedsystem.
• The output clata can be easily mapped with your database also.

In addliloMl (Optlona l):
1 License of Barcode Module - can read liar Code from the OMR Sheet

1 License ofVerifiare (Multiple Template) - Canreadmultiple design ofOMR Sheets

Description of Work

z::z:::­

We trust you find the quote satisfactory and look forward to your business. Please contact

us incase of any questions.

cu,%
(or Ginger Webs Pvt. Ltd.

Sarthak Khandelwal: +91-97176888 24

This is an online quote, no signature neasw,y
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..,
Jagan Mohan <drjagan@gmail.com>

Dr. Jagan Mohan <jagan@mgmcri.ac.in>
To: Sarthak Khandelwal <sarthak.khandelwal@gingerwebs.com>

Dear Mr. Sarthak,
Rs. 30,000 has been transfered to Ginger A/c from our Indian Bank with the following ID:
1BH132 832 09579

10 October 2013 at 15:53

/-

-

Please check and revert.
We would need to install the software tomorrow itself. Can you please send us a USB Dongle for activation by courier
and in the interim, activate an installation temporarily?
We are very much constrained by time and would be grateful for your help.

Thank you,

Jagan Mohan

Dr. Jagan Mohan R., MD MSc FRSM
Head, Department of Information Technology and Medical Informatics
Sri Balaji Vidyapeeth University
Mahatma Gandhi Medical College and Research Institute
Indira Gandhi Institute of Dental Sciences
Kasturba Gandhi Nursing College

Pondicherry 607402
Mob:9894534561
Tel: (0413) 2616707

On Tue, Jul 30, 2013 at 4:21 PM, Sarthak Khandelwal <sarthak.khandelwal@gingerwebs.com> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden)
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i Gmail
Pending Payment for the Scanner

Jagan Mohan <drjagan@gmail.com>

Sarthak Khandelwal <sarthak.khandelwal@gingerwebs.com> 5 November 2013 at 15:47
To: Jagan Mohan R <jagan@mgmcri.ac.in>, Mahalakshmi VN <mahalakshmi@mgmcri.ac.in>
Cc: Sandeep Ale <sandeep.ale@gingerwebs.com>

Dear Ma'am,

As per your reference, I have attached the Quotation on which our deal has been closed. Please find the attached
Quotation.

The Pending payment for the Scanner is Rs 4,200.

You are requested to clear the payment asap.

Looking forward for your reply.

Regards,
Sarthak Khandelwal

(Quoted text hidden]
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Statement of Account from 10/10/2013 to 1&12013

INDIAN BANK
PONDICHERRY
PB No 102,288, MG Road, Pondicherry
Branch Code :00284
Account Number: 725730228
Product type : CA-GEN-PUB-METROISWEEEP-INR

SRI BALAJI VIDYAPEETH
MAHATMA GANDHI MEDICAL COLLEGE COMPLEX
PONDY - CUDDALORE MAIN ROAD
PILLAYARKUPPAM
PONDICHERRY
Email : mgmacet@yahoo.co.in
Statement Date :Tue Mar 16 18:15:45 IST 2021
Cleared Balance :69690.00
Uncleared Amount :0.00
Drawing Power :0.00
Interest Rate: 14.700

Value Date Remitter Branch Description Cheaue No. Debit Amount
10/10/2013 PONDICHERRY WITHDRAWAL TRANSFER MS GINGERWEBS P IDIBH13283209579 TRANSFER TO 89634000124 30000.00
18/10/2013 PONDICHERRY WITHDRAWAL TRANSFER M/S GINGERWEBS IDIBH13291422032 TRANSFER TO 89634000124 31425.00
28/10/2013 PONDICHERRY CHQ TRANSFEINGERWEBS PVT IDIBH13301295799 00061170 75600.00
12/11/2013 PONDICHERRY WITHDRAWAL TRANSFER MS GINGER WEBS P IDIBH13316336726 TRANSFER TO 89634000124 4200.00
StatementDownloaded By SRI BALAJI VIDYAPEETH on Tue Mar 16 18:15:45 1ST 2021 Unless a constituent notifies the Bank

immediately of any discrepancy found by him/her in this statement of ale, it will be taken that he has found the ale correct.
END OF STATEMENT - from Internet Banking
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